Central Depository Services (India) Limited

Convenient # Dependable € Secure

COMMUNIQUE TO DEPOSITORY PARTICIPANTS

CDSL/OPS/DP/POLCY/2023/514 August 31, 2023

SEBI - FACILITATION OF GRIEVANCE REDRESSAL MECHANISM
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2023

DPs are advised to refer to the SEBI Gazette Notification No. Circular viz. No. SEBI/LAD-
NRO/GN/2023/146 dated August 16, 2023 regarding Facilitation of Grievance Redressal

Mechanism (Amendment) Regulation, 2023 [refer Annexure].

DPs are advised to take note of the same.

Queries regarding this communiqué may be addressed to: CDSL — Helpdesk Emails may be sent
to: helpdesk@cdslindia.com and telephone number 08069144800.

sd/-

Sheron Sawant
Sr. Manager — Operations

CDSL : your depository Page 1 of 1



TR & $.ua.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5l -UH.T.-31.-18082023-248175
CG-MH-E-18082023-248175

SFATYTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT | 1—Evs 4
PART I11—Section 4

grfee ¥ TFfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 581] 7= foaoeht, JEEafaaTs, sETEq 17, 2023/4T90T 26, 1945
No. 581] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, AUGUST 17, 2023/SHRAVANA 26, 1945

e whavgfy sik Rt aE
1L

T, 16 3T, 2023
A afevf sik Rt 9
(v fRaTor sqaeT it giaamsae a«mn) (Fenee) e, 2023

., /AU /Siea/2023/146 —ars, wfagfy (@fEan) (RfRaww) sfaf=w, 1956
(1956 T 42) Ft &1 31, WA gfayfa siw BT a1 afaffay, 1992 (1992 #r 15) & g 11,
T 11 T IT-4TT (2) TAT &1 30 3i¥ Aeramme srfafa=m, 1996 (1996 T 22) it & 25 ZTeT et
#r T ATRAT FT TINT FId gU TAERT AT Tiadid 3T AAaT are (i o) &fFaw, 1992,
ar gt s AR a9 (a8 Jwar) @, 1992, wdr wfasfa siv Rffwr a1 (e
TIRIEEY T 9 siawor srfyear) fAafem, 1993 9t wfagf siv A a (Re=w =) B,
1993, 9t sl siw fAffwT o (Retme =) fffaw, 1994, s wfafa sie AffwT 9
(qreEate e A=, 1996, ardiT afagfa s AfawT ae (afes fAfvam =) fafaaw, 1999,
AT giagia s Gffmy a2 [wfog ®=o foaal (Reierese ge sgded) o afaqia e
(R RETed) &1 A9Tae T s9et getagar] [a, 2008, At stayfd s FfFaT a1 s
UTEF H AT (FATHr) daeft doedmer usiHn] f&afFem, 2011, 9 sfagfa s &fRa 3

5305 GI/2023 (8]



2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

[emfes e (Feer) ffeat] AR, 2012, 9rdm g9l oiw @R T [REge ()
aaTear] A aw, 2013, s gfaqia siw BfaT T (sqaae Gyus) BfHaw, 2014, s
gfaqia sie v T (Raer zeee A =m) [fEEw, 2014, araE gogia & GfaaT T

(sram=T fRarer =) @t 2014, s sfagf siv @R i [g=esar () arsgan sic
TR ety fAfHE, 2015, st gfagf siv @ o [mRfEe s sttt (@R
gz TRt &1 0 (399) 3T =t geasan fafaw, 2015, arde s sie @i T
(FrEmmme siw ggarft) Affaw, 2018, wrdia sfagfa siw e a (Tewferar yaue) &faam,
2020 TIAT AT Tiasfa e fAfFwr a2 (afee waos) f@faw, 2021 #1 & goas # F o
freferfera fafaer swmar 8, suaiq-

=4 At & ad sfagfa sie ffawg e (fasrmea Ramr sEer #1 giegrses aaqrr)
(Frerrear) AR, 2023 FET ST T |

T fafs o= § 3 TR g i arE § AL i |

AR Fiafa e BAfaeT ae (vet® o) fafq=w, 1992 4, ™fH=w 9 €, @< (3) H, o=al “T®
AT o FATH 9T 967 “THIE FASL fodl” 37 ST,

AT gfasifa =i AR e (w=e d6r) fafaem, 1992 ,

1.

5.

(1)

(2)

fFw 9% #, su-fafa=w (1) ®, @ (1) ¥, o=al “Us 778 % 1 UL 058 “THT Fie?
et = ST,

o= 289 & are, Meferiaa @R ST STus, sre,-

“forsprara fRaTeor sgee

287, (1) FHe ST (A1) Haerani &r FOehEdl 7 M Seg § Sog fahq Qe ST
I T AT | TH FeT QA & HIae HOT ST IHT TR T STE9T 918 gIT adqTa
ST |

(2) 9T Iq9 AT F AT A 3T dg F FehrEail a1 Fanr gEfsa w3 o7 wea
fFrameor it IR 9% 99T T F forw Rl atst sane (Rerfaa e &1 arerar oft
TET T qHT, ST Rt BT s

AT giagfa & fafaws are (i Tioregre =i e s sitwean) fafaem, 1993 4,

(1)

(2)

= oF #, Su-laffaw (1) 7, @ (%) #, 9=a1 “UF A & S I 053 “THT FAs<
et @ ST,

fafew 15% % o=, Maferfaa B st s, i, -

“ferara fRaTer sraeT

157, (1) vt TR (TREE T 1A 297) 3T 99T Saer Afal (977 S UNia)
fRererst it ferwmaral 1 A Ses & Sew g fAshmra a1 g &t e & ShiE Fease
o1 % T FET Y T THT FET AT A€ G q&>7 7 |




[9TT HI—EvE 4] T T TSI © T 3

(2) 9T Iq9 AT F AT AT T qg T Eal o1 Faer e w3 i POwea
frameor fr wiraT w79 waw F o Rt it wreare (Rerfea [ s areear oft
JaT= &< goaTT, Sar eatha frar s )

6. qre wtagta s i e ((Re= =) B, 1993 7,
(1) BfFw oF ¥, su-faffam (1) 9§, @< (1) ®, o=l “UF A7 F T UL 9051 “THIY FAST
ECIE e
(2  fafeTw 147 % are, Rufia @A et s, seri,-
“TerraT RaTer sEeT

14g. (1) Re=w =t Faernt 1 format w1 [amor Seg ¥ Sog gt s 2=
£ aITE T THE Feie 31 o Frae T 3T IHT TR FT J9T SIS g 9T S0 |

(2) TS 3aT AT & ¥ ¥ 39 a8 | fwmaa; #r Fawer giatsa w3 & e
fraTeor it vt a9 waw F oo B et sae (Rt ) @@ arerar oft
JaT= &< opaTT, St Aetha BT s

7. qra gfasfa =i Bffer @ (Rwe S9m) faf=aE, 1994 +,
(1) T 8% ®, su-fAafFaw (1) ®, @< () ¥, 9Isa1 “UF A9 F T 9T 9768 “THT FAeT
=t s ST
2  fafaaw 167 ¥ are, Fuferfaa Aff St srom, starfe -
“Forrara fRaTor sEeT
169. (1) fastae ST (492 g U T97) Ferersht £t forsprarat &7 fRamer steg & 9o g

forRTIa W B T AT T THW FAe QT % HIaC HAT 3T IHT TR HAT 9T a8
T FATIT ST |

(2) 9T Iq9 THA F A< ¥ 37 q¥g o faraar &1 Fawor giafea v & e
fFrameor it IR 9% 99T T F forw e atst sane (Rertaa e & arerar oft
JaT= &< goparT, Star Aeatha BT s )

8. AT gfasfa i fofame o (aeeafr i) f@fFem, 1996 #, fafa=w 60 & e, Fwforfaa
“frerae fAaTer sEeT
60F. (1) Teq Taer FUAT (70 s HuwT) Haerni it emar w1 Fawor seg ¥ Seg g

forsrTra wT g T A F THE Fee) oAt & fiaT FE ST S TR RO 9T 9 g
FATAT ST |

(2) 9T 3Iq9 THA # HIAL ¥ 3T qE o FAwrAql #7 Mo gHtad i o7 fwma Hamwor
#1 IR a9 T forg Rt it wreae (R [Aermr) st areaar oft gee s ae,
ST FRratha T s

9. AT Tiagfa =i fafaas are (@rgfes A =) A, 1999 ,




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

10.

11.

12.

(1)  RfREE 114, g3 () 7, qe31 “TF G F T U 07 THE FAS (Al A S0,
(2) RfREE 147 % ame, Fetafeaa @R strer so, i, -
“frepTaT RaTeor spae

147, (1) oriRs FRaer vy Fadr et £ foermat &1 [amer see 7 og &g

forRTara wTe g Y AT | T Fere AT o T w0 T S TR w3l S| e
ZTT IATAT ST |

(2) 9T Iq9 AT F A< ¥ 7 q¥g & fawrar w1 Fawor gt - & g
frameor fr wiraT w79 waw F o Rt et wreare (Rerfea ) s areear oft
JaT= &< goarT, Star Aatha T s )

areetT s s Affar a1 [sfosm = freat (Fenferse 2 mgien) s afagf
e (R fefew) 1 e i seht geagan) &A=, 2008 ¥,

(1) BRI 7 ¥ g @), o=@l “UF qm° % T 9¥ 9058 “THT Fed s faql” A1 ST,
(2) RFEEwE 11 ¥, 3u-faH=w (3) #, @< (F) F 1%, FefriEd @€ SeT STus, i, -

“(R) Teerht T forRrrdt 1 fHemeor Stog | srex fohq forhraT a8 g T aE | g
FAeT faAT & JIaT FOT ST IHT TR FGT SAGT A1 G Fd 1T ATT |

() s 11 % A=, Fwferfea Al et s, s,
“forarraa fRaTeor saae

11%. FTS 3Ia+ 0T * Wia< 3T 39 avg | forwrrat &1 e gfafag w2 i fowma
fFrameor it IR 9% 99T T F forw el atst e (Rertaa ) &1 arerar oft
TT T qT, ST et B s

areat Il siv Affms 1€ (s arew i SRy (GrEredt) geet s s AR,
2011 ¥, fafe=w 16@ * arg, Feferfaa fF = et s, srriq,-

“frprara fRaTeor sgeeT

16T (1) FarTHT daeft Tord o usidT Faert i fowmat #1 e Sog & seg &g fowma
T 219 AT T T THE Feer fa| & fiaw O e I TEwe w0 9T 8 gRT aqran
ST

(2) AT Iq9 FHA F AL ¥ 3T A | At F1 Fareor gRtad T i fOwma e
#1 IR a9 T F forg Rt aiEt wreae (Rerfea ) & aeedar oSt sere S aee,
ST FRratha T s

A Ttasfa =i fafawT o [srasteas e (Fae) e e, 2012 #, BfRaw 24
+ are, Mafried A= ST ST, s, -

“frsprara fRaTeer sgeeT

24%. (1) Weg® Haerani s foeEar &1 [awer Sex § Sz &g fOwma a1 g & ade |
THT Feie? AT F FiaT F3 3T SH T FE0 9T 9IS g7 9747 77 |




[9TT HI—EvE 4] T T TSI © T 5

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

(2) AT Iq9 THA # HIAL ¥ 3T qE o FAFIAT F7 Faor gHtad F o7 fwmd e
#1 IFAT T T T & o Rt Sty seae (Remfaa =) & arerar ot see 2 9T,
ST FRratha e s

q gfagfa o Affw i [EfRye (FReen) geresr] &R, 2013 7, @fFw 21 4, 39-
= (1) % v o= efofaa so-Efaae o STosm, ser,-

“(1) TaeT AATEHIT [Heerahi S Fehraai &1 Harr sfeg | Seg fhq forewmaa ama g #F aiE o
THT Feie? T F FaT FE 3T IH T FET AT 9re g FqTdT J1Y |7

AT wagfa i Bffwr i (g &gus) @R, 2014 4, BfFaw 26 % T,

“forprara fRaTeor seeT

26@. (1) dqEaT™ Agus Mot $ fawmear w1 [Famor se & Sog &g fma s g  #i
ATE T THE Feie? (ol & FiaT T 3T IH THTE F3T 49T dr€ gTT adq1d7 T |

(2) 9T Iq9 FHA # HIA¥ ¥ 3T q¥g o It #7 e gRtaa 3 o7 fOwma e
F1 IferaT 9% 9T T & forg Rt it sede (Rerfea [Rer) &t arear ot see w7 g9,
ST FRratha T s

AR S iz BfasT a ((REe 3&ee Maa =) fafqaw, 2014 4, & 265 # T,
“frer fAeTr ST

269. (1) wags [Aeerai #r oAt &1 [awer Sex ¥ Sex &g fOwma g g9 & ag |
THT FeAe ol F Fae FT ST IHT THTL FHT STAT A1 gTT 13T AT |

(2) 9T 3Iq9 THA F HIAY ¥ 3T qE | fAwmat F7 Faror gRtad # of7 fOwma Hamwor
#T TRAT T T @A & o et atey seae (RRTtaa fAeer) &1 Jrerar ot s& T 9T,
ST Retha e s )
AT Ffagfa i BfamT a2 (sraEewEar Fae =) &@fFaw, 2014 4, & 262 F T,
“ferra RaTer sEe

265. (1) Yag® Maeri & famar #71 Faw Sog & Sog g e T | i ane |
THT Feie? (ol F HIaT FET ST IHT THTL FET 9T 9IS T 797 AT |

(2) 9T Iq9 THA #F AT ¥ 3T qg o Fwraql &7 Faor gRtad 3 o7 fOwma e
#1 IferaT a9 T & forg Rt it wreae (Rerfea ) s areedar oSt sere S aee,
ST FRratha T s

AT Sadgfa e AT a1 [getagar (o) arerard siv s svamd] e,
2015 ¥, faff=aw 13 ¥,

(1) SRR (1) F s o Fetrfe so-fEtREw e s, sei,-




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

18.

19.

20.

(2)

“(1) T=tag (rffee) fedt et #t At &7 Har Sog 7 Seq g e s
2 FT T ¥ T Fae At F Fiaw w0 S T TR #0097 9 gy aqr
ST |

su-fafa (4) ¥ are, Muferfag so-fEfREw ser s, s, -

“(5) 1S 3a FHY *F W S 37 a4 & frerradi 1 Femor gRfera w27 i foewma
frameor fr sk uw Ae e F o Gt it sreae (R [err) @ argar of
TaT T g, ST Hethia e s

qre gfagfa siv FfFwr a1 (SRR s sfagfaat (@R S feeids) @ e
(397) 3T 3T GAtaaan) A=, 2015 #, Gfew 279 F are, Feffag GRew st s,

“forarraa fRaTeor srae

2771, (1) fntoeat (3eger) et #T femar w1 [Ramer Sog ¥ o g fOwma g g #i
ATE T THE Feie? fadl & Fiae FT 3T IHT THTL HOT 9T aT€ gTT adq147 J77 |

(2) 9T Iq9 FHA F HIA¥ ¥ 3T qg o fwradt #7 e gRtaa 3 i fOwma Hamr
¥ IFAT T T Taq F oo e iy seane (Remfaa ) @ arerar ot see w5 e,
ST FRratha T s

A gfasifa =i fafae e (e s agwrt) fafaew, 2018 +,

(1)
(2)

)

A= 7 7, @ (2) ¥, aeai ‘T &A1 F #19 97 06 “FHE Feis? QA1 A JA0>;
aff=m 36 #, 3u-faffaw (2) 7, @< (7) #, 9r=at ‘i &A1 & 19 92 o053 “THT Fode<
fasTi e ST,

= 72 % v = et A= e s, s -

“forraa AT sgaeT

72. (1) fwedl (39F3R) AT IFHT Tsie AT =39 AFIAT & qga Grdr wegadr
(ZeTHITRTRN) % & | Toree? il ATh Haeri it fawmdt &1 Faror s & seg &g
fOrsRTara T I T AT H T Fele? Al % HaT R ST IHT THRL RS 9T de
FTT FATAT ST |

(2) 9T Iq9 AT F A< ¥ 37 qg o fraraar 1 Fawor giafea w1 & e
fFrameor it IR 9% 99T T F forw ol atst svane (Rerfaa e &t arerar o
TET FL qT, ST et BT s

AT Tiagfa =i fafaw are (Trewrfemt sdg) Bfaaw, 2020 F,

(1)
(2)

A =w 11 9, g () ¥, o1&l “UF A7 % T I 9061 “THT FeAS< (ol 3 JT0r;
fafaee 34 % arg, et AfFae srer ST, s, -



[9TT HI—EvE 4] T T TSI © T 7

“fersprara fRaTeer sgeeT

34%F. (1) TERITAT Yaga Harerhi 6T fermaar w1 [amr Sog ¥ Sog fhg fomwma s
2 FT AT ¥ TH Fae? At F diae F ST T R FT 9T a9 g adqrar
Sl

(2) 9T Ia9 AT F A7 A7 7 avg ¥ forwraat w1 Ao gt w1 & o
fraTeer it v u 99T wEe & forw BT aiet wae (Rt M) @ arerar oSt
JaT= &< opaTT, St etha BT s )

21.  9RdE Iiagia o FfHaT e (atee yagF) afaaw, 2021 4, BFfaaw 16% F arg, Rutea

“torepTara R sereT

16. (1) Flee Tags Faeet #T fOwar w1 Fawr Seg & Sea g o s g i
T THT Feie faAl F Frae O 3T IUT TR FT ST9T A1 g1 SqT3T A7 |

(2) 9T Iq9 THA * HIAY ¥ 3T q¥g o Fwraat #71 e gRtaa 3 i fOwma e
FI TRAT T 9L @A & o et atet swede (ARrtaa ) & areaar ot J& &7 9o,
ST Retta e s )

FATAT TS, FAITAF H39TH
[Fr=TTa=-111/4/3147./363/2023-24]

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE BOARD OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
Mumbai, the 16th August, 2023

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE BOARD OF INDIA (FACILITATION OF GRIEVANCE REDRESSAL
MECHANISM) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2023

No. SEBI/LAD-NRO/GN/2023/146.—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 31 of the Securities
Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956 (42 of 1956), section 11, sub-section (2) of section 11A and section 30 of the
Securities and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992 (15 of 1992) and section 25 of the Depositories Act, 1996 (22 of
1996), the Board hereby makes the following regulations to further amend the Securities and Exchange Board of India
(Stock Brokers) Regulations, 1992, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Merchant Bankers) Regulations,
1992, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Registrars to an Issue and Share Transfer Agents) Regulations,
1993, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Debenture Trustees) Regulations, 1993, the Securities and
Exchange Board of India (Bankers to an Issue) Regulations, 1994, the Securities and Exchange Board of India
(Mutual Funds) Regulations, 1996, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Collective Investment Schemes)
Regulations, 1999, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Issue and Listing of Securitised Debt Instruments and
Security Receipts) Regulations, 2008, the Securities and Exchange Board of India {KYC (Know Your Client)
Registration Agency} Regulations, 2011, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Alternative Investment Funds)
Regulations, 2012, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Investment Advisers) Regulations, 2013, the
Securities and Exchange Board of India (Research Analysts) Regulations, 2014, the Securities and Exchange Board of
India (Real Estate Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Infrastructure
Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Listing Obligations and Disclosure
Requirements) Regulations, 2015, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Issue and Listing of Municipal Debt
Securities) Regulations, 2015, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Depositories and Participants)
Regulations, 2018, the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Portfolio Managers) Regulations, 2020 and the
Securities and Exchange Board of India (Vault Managers) Regulations, 2021, namely:—

1. These regulations may be called the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Facilitation of Grievance
Redressal Mechanism) (Amendment) Regulations, 2023.



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IlI—SEC.4]
2. They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
3. In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Stock Brokers) Regulations, 1992, in regulation 9, in clause
(e), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-one calendar days” shall be substituted;
4, In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Merchant Bankers) Regulations, 1992,
(1) in regulation 9A, in sub-regulation (1), in clause (c), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-

)

one calendar days” shall be substituted;
after regulation 28B, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely, —
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

28C. (1) The Merchant Banker shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-
one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified
by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

5. In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Registrars to an Issue and Share Transfer Agents)
Regulations, 1993,

)

)

in regulation 9A, in sub-regulation (1), in clause (e), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-
one calendar days” shall be substituted

after regulation 15B, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely, —
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

15C. (1) The registrar to an issue and share transfer agent shall redress investor grievances promptly
but not later than twenty-one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such
manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”;

6. In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Debenture Trustees) Regulations, 1993,

1)

)

in regulation 9A, in sub-regulation (1), in clause (c), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-
one calendar days” shall be substituted;

after regulation 14A, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely, —
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

14B. (1) The debenture trustee shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-
one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified
by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

7. In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Bankers to an Issue) Regulations, 1994,

1)

)

in regulation 8A, in sub-regulation (1), in clause (d), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-
one calendar days” shall be substituted;

after regulation 16A, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely, —
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

16B. (1) The banker to an issue shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-
one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified
by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”.

8. In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Mutual Funds) Regulations, 1996, after regulation 60, the
following shall be inserted, namely, —

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.



[9TT HI—EvE 4] T T TSI © T 9

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

60A. (1) The asset management company shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than
twenty-one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified
by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Collective Investment Schemes) Regulations 1999,

(1) in regulation 11, in clause (f), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-one calendar days”
shall be substituted;

(2) after regulation 14A, the following shall be inserted, namely, -
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

14B. (1) The Collective Investment Management Company shall redress investor grievances
promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in
such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”;

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Issue and Listing of Securitised Debt Instruments and
Security Receipts) Regulations, 2008,

(1) in regulation 7, in clause (c), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-one calendar days”
shall be substituted.

(2) inregulation 11, in sub-regulation (3), after clause (q), the following shall be inserted, namely, -

“(r) redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days from the date
of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.”;

(3) after regulation 11, the following shall be inserted, namely, -
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

11A. The Board may recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India {KYC (Know Your Client) Registration Agency} Regulations,
2011, after regulation 16B, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely, —

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

16C. (1) The KRA shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”;

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Alternative Investment Funds) Regulations, 2012, after
regulation 24, the following shall be inserted, namely, -

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

24A. (1) The Manager shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Investment Advisers) Regulations, 2013, in regulation 21,
sub-regulation (1) shall be substituted with the following, namely, -

“(1) The Investment Adviser shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one
calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the
Board.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Research Analysts) Regulations, 2014, after regulation 26A,
the following shall be inserted, namely, —

“Redressal of investor grievances



10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

26B. (1) The Research Analyst shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one
calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Real Estate Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014, after
regulation 26E, the following shall be inserted, namely, -

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

26F. (1) The Manager shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Infrastructure Investment Trusts) Regulations, 2014, after
regulation 26K, the following shall be inserted, namely, -

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

26L.. (1) The Manager shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Listing Obligations and Disclosure Requirements)
Regulations 2015, in regulation 13,

1) sub-regulation (1) shall be substituted with the following, namely, -

“(1) The listed entity shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one
calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by
the Board.”.

2 after sub-regulation (4), the following sub-regulation shall be inserted, namely, -

“(5) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In Securities and Exchange Board of India (Issue and Listing of Municipal Debt Securities) Regulations,
2015, after regulation 27B, the following shall be inserted, namely, -

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

27C. (1) The issuer shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Depositories and Participants) Regulations, 2018,

1) in regulation 7, in clause (g), for the words “thirty days”, the words “twenty-one calendar days”
shall be substituted;

2 in regulation 36, in sub-regulation (2), in clause (f), for the words “thirty days”, the words “twenty-
one calendar days” shall be substituted;

3) regulation 72 shall be substituted with the following, namely —
“Redressal of investor grievances

72. (1) The issuer or its agent or any person who is registered as an intermediary under these
regulations shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one calendar days
from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Portfolio Managers) Regulations, 2020,



[9TT HI—EvE 4] T T TSI © T 11

21.

1) in regulation 11, in clause (d), for the words “one month”, the words “twenty-one calendar days”
shall be substituted;

2 after regulation 34, the following shall be inserted, namely, -
“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

34A. (1) The Portfolio Manager shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-
one calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified
by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of
grievance redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

In the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Vault Managers) Regulations, 2021, after regulation 16A, the
following shall be inserted, namely, -

“Grievance Redressal Mechanism.

16B. (1) The Vault Manager shall redress investor grievances promptly but not later than twenty-one
calendar days from the date of receipt of the grievance and in such manner as may be specified by the Board.

(2) The Board may also recognize a body corporate for handling and monitoring the process of grievance
redressal within such time and in such manner as may be specified.”

BABITHA RAYUDU, Executive Director
[ADVT.-111/4/Exty./363/2023-24]

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.





